PROCUREMENT CONTRACTS OFFICER:
BRENDA SENSIBAUGH

6891 OF

NEBRASKA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

OPENING DATE: JULY 15, 2024

CONTROL CABINETS FOR VARIABLE SPEED ADVISORY SIGNS, CAMERA TOWERS AND
AUTO GATES Mid American Signal, Inc. Mobo Trex Traffic Control Corporation
UNIT UNIT UNIT EXTENDED
LINE # DESCRIPTION Qry UOM PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE PRICE
2070 TRAFFIC SIGNAL
1 CONTROLLER CHASSIS 30 EA $2,507.00 | $ 75,210.00 | $3,979.00 | $ 119,370.00 | $2,550.00 | $ 76,500.00
2070 1C CPU MODULE
2 |WITH Q-FREE MAXTIME 25 EA $2,743.00 | S 68,575.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
(WITH LICENSE)
2070 1C CPU MODULE WITH
3 Q-FREE MAXTIME 25 EA $1,694.00 | S 42,350.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
(WITHOUT LICENSE)

4 |Q-FREE MAXTIME WITH LICENSE 15 EA $1,049.00 | S 15,735.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL: S 201,870.00 S 119,370.00 S 76,500.00
PAYMENT TERMS: NA %, NA DAYSS 0% 0%, 45 DAYS
DELIVERY DAYS ARO: 45 Days 45 days 60 days

SAFETRAN
On line Three vendor crossed out 20700C0G6500 2070
COMMENTS: with Q-Free maxtime CONTROLLER W/OUT 1C

10F1



